Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2 3

Bull Rock, Clean Colorado Materials New Braunfels Matagorda Construction Prihoda Gravel

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 650 Material | Delivery Matgrial * Material | Delivery Matgrial * Material | Delivery Matgrial *

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 14.00  19.50]  33.50] 2 29.15  12.00]  41.15 16.00  11.00]  27.00] 1

Any County Road 14.00 21.50] 3550 2 29.15  12.00[  41.15 16.00 12.00] 28.00[ 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 14.00  21.00]  35.00] 2 29.15  12.00]  41.15 16.00  12.00] 28.00] 1

Any County Road 14.00 2250 36.50] 2 29.15  12.00]  41.15 16.00 13.00] 29.00[ 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 14.00  20.50]  34.50] 2 29.15  12.00]  41.15 16.00(  14.00]  30.00] 1

Any County Road 14.00  23.00] 37.00] 2 29.15[  12.00]  41.15 16.00 16.00] 32.00[ 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 1400 2250 3650 2 | 29.15] 12.00]  41.15] 16.00 14.00] 30.00] 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 1400 2500 39.00f 2 | 29.15 12.00] 41.15] 16.00 16.00] 32.00] 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 1400 2650 4050 2 | 29.15 12.00]  41.15] 16.00 16.00] 32.00] 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 14.00] 2050  34.50| | 2915 1200 4115 16.00]  14.00]  30.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 14,00[******xx | 43.70[*****xxx | p1.3 p2.1,P3-2 16.00[*******x|  p1.1 p3-1,P4-1
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx Bay City Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas 2
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

(CONTINUED) 4

Bull Rock, Clean Vulcan

L8 Ui . . Material + . . Material + . . Material +

Total Quantity: 650 Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 20.00 59.68 79.68 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 20.00 59.68 79.68 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 20.00 62.29 82.29 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 20.00 62.29 82.29 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 20.00 62.29 82.29 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 20.00 62.29 82.29 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | 2000 64.89] 84.89| | | | 0.00| | | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | 2000 6880 88.80 | | | 0.00| | | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | 2000 6880 88.80| | | | 0.00] | | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | 2000 6229 @ 82.29 | | | 0.00] | | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 20.00'******** | |******** | |******** |
Pick-Up Location Helotes

Bid Results FY 2020 1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Bull Rock, with Clay ! . . 2

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Prihoda Gravel

fotallQuantity-1650 Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 12.00 11.00 23.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 12.00 12.00 24.00 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 12.00 12.00 24.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 12.00 13.00 25.00 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 12.00 14.00 26.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 12.00 16.00 28.00 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 12.00] 1400 26.00] 1 | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 12000 16.00[ 28.00] 1 | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | 12.00] 16.00[ 28.00] 1 | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 12.00] 1400 26.00] 1 | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 12,00 [ *****xxx | P3-1 12.00[¥*¥*¥***5% | o1y 0013001151 [ xxknnk |
Pick-Up Location Terryville Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Pea 3/8" ! . 2 .

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Matagorda Construction

fotallQuantity- 1850 Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 11.00 32.10 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 9.00 30.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 11.00 32.10 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1000[ 3110 1 | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1150 32.60] 1 | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | 2110 1150 3260 1 | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1000[ 3110 1 | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 22.00'******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 33.00'******** | P1-2,P2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2 |******** |
Pick-Up Location Terryville Bay City

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Pea 5/8" ! . 2 .

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Matagorda Construction

Total Quantity: 850 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 11.00 32.10 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 9.00 30.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 21.10 10.00 31.10 1 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 21.10 11.00 32.10 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1000 3110 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1150 3260 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | 2110 1150 3260 1 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 2110 1000 3110 1 | | 0.00|
Pickup
PiCk-Up 22.00'******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 33.00'******** | P1-2,P2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2 |******** |
Pick-Up Location Terryville Bay City

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Pit Run ! . . 2 3

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Prihoda Gravel Zbranek Gravel

lotaliQuantity- 8,750 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 4.75 9.00 13.75 1 4.50 10.00 14.50 2

Any County Road 0.00 4.75 11.00 15.75 1 4.50 12.00 16.50 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 4.75 6.50 11.25 1 4.50 7.50 12.00 2

Any County Road 0.00 4.75 8.50 13.25 1 4.50 9.50 14.00 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 4.75 9.75 14.50 1 4.50 10.75 15.25 2

Any County Road 0.00 4.75 11.50 16.25 1 4.50 12.50 17.00 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 475 9.000 13.75] 1 450 10.00] 1450 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| |  475] 1100 1575 1 450 11.75] 16.25] 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| |  475] 1100 1575 1 450 12.00] 16.50] 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 475 9.000 1375 1 450 10.00] 1450 2
Pickup
Pick-Up 7.00|******** | P1.3,p2-3,r3-3,r4-3,T5-3 4.00|******** | P1-1,p2-1,P3-1,P4-1,T5-1 4.50|******** | P1.2,p2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2
Pick-Up Location Terryville Altair Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Post Oak Pit Run w/Red Clay
Unit: Tons

1

All Star Materials

Total Quantity: 12,500 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Pickup
PiCk-Up 7.50|******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 |******** | |******** |
Pick-Up Location Terryville

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Screened ! . . 2 3

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Prihoda Gravel Zbranek Gravel

lotaliQuantity:110,750 Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 9.25 15.50 1 6.25 10.00 16.25 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 11.25 17.50 1 6.25 12.00 18.25 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 6.75 13.00 1 6.25 7.50 13.75 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 8.75 15.00 1 6.25 9.50 15.75 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 10.00 16.25 1 6.25 10.75 17.00 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 11.75 18.00 1 6.25 12.50 18.75 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 625 925 1550 1 6.25| 10.00] 16.25] 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 625] 1100 1725 1 6.25| 1175 18.00 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | 625] 1125 1750 1 6.25| 12.00] 18.25] 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 625 875 1500 1 6.25| 10.00] 16.25] 2
Pickup
Pick-Up 8.50|******** | P1-3,p2-3,P3-3,P4-3,T5-3 5.75|******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 6.25|******** | P1-2,P2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2
Pick-Up Location Terryville Altair Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Gravel, Screened w/Red Clay ! . . 2 3

Unit: Tons All Star Materials Prihoda Gravel Zbranek Gravel

fotaliQuantity:111,500 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 9.25 15.50 1 6.25 10.00 16.25 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 11.25 17.50 1 6.25 12.00 18.25 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 6.75 13.00 1 6.25 7.50 13.75 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 8.75 15.00 1 6.25 9.50 15.75 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 6.25 10.00 16.25 1 6.25 10.75 17.00 2

Any County Road 0.00 6.25 11.75 18.00 1 6.25 12.50 18.75 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 6.25| 9.25] 1550 1 6.25] 10.00] 16.25] 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | 6.25| 11.00] 17.25] 1 6.25] 11.75] 18.00] 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | 625] 1125 1750 1 6.25| 12.00] 18.25] 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | 6.25| 8.75] 15.00] 1 6.25| 1000 1625 2
Pickup
Pick-Up 8.50|******** | P1.3,p2-3,r3-3,r4-3,T5-3 5.75|******** | P1-1,p2-1,P3-1,P4-1,T5-1 6.25|******** | P1.2,p2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2
Pick-Up Location Terryville Altair Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

10

Lime, Hi-Cal Hydrated, Bagged 1,

Unit: Tons Lhoist

Total Quantity: 375 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 41.89 256.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 215.00 41.89] 256.89] 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 215.00 41.89] 256.89] 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 215.00 41.89] 256.89] 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 215.00 41.89] 256.89] 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Pickup
PiCk-Up 215.00'******** | P1-1,p2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 |******** | |******** |

Pick-Up Location

New Braunfels

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

11

Lime, Hydrated, Not-Bagged Lh:)i i

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 875 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 41.89 176.89 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | 13500 4189 17689 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | 13500 4189 17689 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | 13500 4189 17689 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | 135.00] 4189 17689 1 | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Pickup
PiCk-Up 135.00 |******** | P1-1,p2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 |******** | |******** |

Pick-Up Location

New Braunfels

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

12

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust ! . . 2 . 3 .

Unit: Tons Matagorda Construction Prihoda Gravel Quality Hot Mix

lotaliQuantity-3,300 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 5.50 18.15 23.65 2 0.00 5.50 16.25 21.75 1

Any County Road 5.50 19.15 24.65 2 0.00 5.50 17.25 22.75 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 5.50 18.15 23.65 2 0.00 5.50 16.50 22.00 1

Any County Road 5.50 19.15 24.65 2 0.00 5.50 17.00 22.50 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 5.50 18.15 23.65 2 0.00 5.50 16.25 21.75 1

Any County Road 5.50 19.15 24.65 2 0.00 5.50 17.25 22.75 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 550 1850 24.000 2 | | 0.00| 550 17.00] 2250 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 550 2200 2750 2 | | 0.00| 550 17.00] 2250 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 550 2200 2750 2 | | 0.00| 550 17.00] 2250 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 550 1815 2365 1 | | 0.00| 550 19.00] 2450 2
Pickup
Pick-Up 31.20'******** | P1.3,p2-3,r3-3,r4-3,T5-3 26.25|******** | P1-1,p2-1,P3-1,P4-1,T5-1 28.00'******** | P1.2,p2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2
Pick-Up Location Bay City Altair New Taiton/El Campo

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

13

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1" .1 ; ; ; >

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Matagorda Construction Prihoda Gravel

Total Quantity: 5,500 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 5.00 19.50 24.50 3 5.00 18.15 23.15 1 0.00

Any County Road 5.00 21.50 26.50 3 5.00 19.15 24.15 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 5.00 21.00 26.00 3 5.00 18.15 23.15 2 0.00

Any County Road 5.00 22.50 27.50 3 5.00 19.15 24.15 2 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 5.00 20.50 25.50 3 5.00 18.15 23.15 1 0.00

Any County Road 5.00 23.00 28.00 3 5.00 19.15 24.15 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 5000 2250 2750 3 | 500/ 1850 2350 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 500 2500 3000 3 | 500/ 2200 27.00] 2 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 500 2650 3150 3 | 500/ 2200 27.00] 2 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 5000 2050 25500 3 | 500/ 1815 2315 1 | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 5.00[¥**xxkkx | P3-1 30.60[***x*xx | 23.75[******xx | p1.1 P2-1,P4-1,P3-2
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx Bay City Altair

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

14

(CONTINUED) 4 5

Limestone, 11/2" to 1" Quality Hot Mix Vulcan

Dl et . . Material + . . Material + . . Material +

Total Quantity: 5,500 Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 4.50 18.90 23.40 2 30.00 49.12 79.12 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 19.90 24.40 2 30.00 49.12 79.12 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 4.50 18.50 23.00 1 30.00 48.39 78.39 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 19.50 24.00 1 30.00 48.39 78.39 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 4.50 18.90 23.40 2 30.00 49.12 79.12 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 19.90 24.40 2 30.00 49.12 79.12 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 450 1910 23.60] 2 | 30.00] 4758  77.58] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 450 1910 2360 1 | 30.00] 4758  77.58] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road 450 2010 2460 1 | 30.00] 4758  77.58] | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile 450 19.00 2350 2 | 30.00] 49.12[  79.12] | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 28.00'******** | P1-2,P2-2,P4-2 30.00'******** | |******** |
Pick-Up Location New Taiton/El Campo Freeport

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

15

Limestone, Dust ,1 . 2 . 3 .

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Prihoda Gravel Quality Hot Mix

lotaliQuantity-1,000 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 3.00[ 1950 22550 1 0.00 6.00[ 2000 26.00] 2

Any County Road 3.000 2150 2450 1 0.00 6.00 2100 27.00] 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 3.00f 2100 24.00[ 1 0.00 6.00[ 20.00[ 26.00] 2

Any County Road 3.000 2250 2550 1 0.00 6.00 2100 27.00] 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 3.000 2050 2350 1 0.00 6.00( 20.00] 26.00] 2

Any County Road 3.000 23.00f 26.00 1 0.00 6.00f 2100 27.00] 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 3.00] 2250 2550 1 | | | 0.00| 6.00] 23.00] 29.00] 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 3.00] 2500 2800 1 | | | 0.00| 6.00] 2400 3000 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road 3.00] 2650 2950 1 | | | 0.00| 6.00] 2400 3000 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile 3.00] 2050 2350 1 | | | 0.00| 6.00] 19.00] 2500 2
Pickup
Pick-Up 3.00[*¥**xxkkx | P3-1 23.75[*xxxkrx | P3-2,P4-2 29.00[***xx*xx | P4-1
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx Altair New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

16

Limestone, Grade 5 (Ice Rock) ,1 2 . . 3 .

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Matagorda Construction Quality Hot Mix

lotaliQuantity:2,450 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 25.00]  19.50|  44.50] 3 14.70]  18.15| 32.85] 1 25.00]  17.50] 4250 2

Any County Road 25.00 2150 46.50] 3 1470 19.15] 33.85] 1 25.00 19.50] 44.50[ 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 25.00]  21.00]  46.00 3 14.70]  18.15| 32.85] 1 25.00  20.00] 45.00[ 2

Any County Road 25.00 2250 4750 3 1470 19.15] 33.85] 1 25.00 2100 46.00 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 25.00]  20.50|  45.50] 3 14.70]  18.15| 32.85] 1 25.00 17.50]  42.50[ 2

Any County Road 25.00 23.00 48.00 3 1470 19.15] 33.85] 1 25.00 19.50] 4450 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 25.000 22550 4750 3 | 1470 1850 33.20] 1 25.00 2100 46.00 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 25.000 2500 5000 3 | 1470 2200 3670 1 25.00 22.00 47.00 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road 25.000 26550 5150 3 | 1470 2200 3670 1 25.00 2100 46.00 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile 25.00]  20.50]  45.50] | 1470 1815] 32.85| 25.00 19.50]  44.50|
Pickup
Pick-Up 25.00 [ ****xxxx | P3-1 44,00[***xxxkx | P4-1 40.00[******+* [ p1.1 p2-1,P3-2,P4-2
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx Bay City New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2020

1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

17

Limestone, Non-Coated, Grade 4 ,1 . 2 .

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Quality Hot Mix

Total Quantity: 1,950 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 20.00 19.50|  39.50[ 2 15.00  19.00]  34.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 20.00( 21.50[ 4150 2 15.00  20.00] 35.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 20.00( 21.00] 41.00[ 2 15.00  20.00] 35.00] 1 0.00

Any County Road 20.00( 2250 4250 2 15.00 21.00] 36.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 20.00 20.50|  40.50[ 2 15.00  19.00]  34.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 20.00 23.00 43.00 2 15.00 19.00] 34.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 20.000 22550 4250 2 | 1500 19.00] 34.00] 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 20.00 2500 4500 2 | 15.00] 2000 3500 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 20.000 26550 4650 2 | 15.00] 21.00] 36.00] 1 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 20.00]  20.50]  40.50] | 1500 20.00[ 35.00 | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 20.00[***x**xx | P3-1,P4-2 37.50[******x+ | p1.1 P2-1,P4-1,P3-2 |

Pick-Up Location

5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx

New Taiton
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Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4 ,1 . 2 . 3

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Quality Hot Mix Vulcan

Total Quantity: 1,700 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 40.00  19.50|  59.50[ 2 49.00 8.00 57.00] 1 22.00 60.39]  82.39

Any County Road 40.00{  21.50] 61.50[ 2 49.00 9.00f 5800 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 40.00{  21.00]  61.00[ 2 49.00 9.00f 5800 1 22.00(  62.00]  84.00

Any County Road 40.00  22.50] 62.50[ 2 49.00(  10.00] 59.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 40.00{  20.50|  60.50] 2 49.00 8.00 57.00] 1 22.00 61.19]  83.19

Any County Road 40.00{ 23.00 63.00] 2 49.00 9.00f 5800 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 40.00f 2250 6250 2 | 49.00] 10.00] 59.00] 1 22.000 6359 8559 3
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 40.00f 2500 6500 2 | 49.00] 11.00] 60.00] 1 22.000 6359 8559 3
Precinct #4

Any County Road 40.00f 26.50 6650 2 | 49.00] 11.00] 60.00] 1 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 40.00[  20.50]  60.50] | 49.00] 9.00  58.00| 22.00  62.00] 84.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 40.00[*****xx | P3-1 49.00[*****x+x | p1.1 p2.1,P4-1,P3-2|  22.00[*****xxx |
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx New Taiton Uvalde Plant

Bid Results FY 2020
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Mix, Cold ,1 . 2 . 3

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials New Braunfels Quality Hot Mix Vulcan

Total Quantity: 2,100 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 67.00( 21.50| 88.50| 2 74.00 8.00  82.00 1 40.00{  78.39| 118.39

Any County Road 67.00( 2350 90.50[ 2 74.00 9.00f 83.00 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 67.00  23.00 90.00] 2 74.00 9.00[ 83.00] 1 40.00{  80.00| 120.00

Any County Road 67.00( 24.50[ 9150 2 74.00( 1000 84.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 67.00 22.50| 89.50| 2 74.00 8.00  82.00 1 40.00{  79.19] 119.19

Any County Road 67.00(  25.00 92.00] 2 74.00 9.00f 83.00] 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 67.00 2450 9150 2 | 7400/ 1000 84.00] 1 40.00[  81.59] 121.59
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 67.000 27.000 9400 2 | 7400 11.00] 8500 1 40.00[  81.59] 121.59
Precinct #4

Any County Road 67.00 2850 9550 2 | 7400 11.00] 8500 1 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 67.00 2250 8950 2 |  74.00] 9.000 83.00] 1 40.00[  80.00[ 120.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 67.00***x*xx | P3-2 74.00[******x+ | p1.1 P2-1,P3-1,P4-1|  40.00[*****x*+ |
Pick-Up Location 5080 FM 2439 New Braunfels Tx New Taiton Uvalde Plant
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(CONTINUED) 4

Mix, Cold Waller County Asphalt

LIS . Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantrty; 2’100 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 92.00 23.00 115.00 3 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 92.00 23.00 115.00 3 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 92.00 22.00 114.00 3 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 92.00 22.00 114.00 3 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 92.00 24.00 116.00 3 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 92.00 24.00 116.00 3 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 92.00[ 24.00 11600 3 | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 92.00 24.00 11600 3 | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 92.00[ 24.00 11600 3 | | 0.00| | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 92.00 24.00 11600 3 | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 92.00'******** | P2-2,P4-2 |******** | |******** |

Pick-Up Location

22010 Fairgrounds Rd Hempstead, Tx

Bid Results FY 2020
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Mix, Hot ! . . 2 .

Unit: Tons Colorado Materials Nursery Quality Hot Mix

Total Quantity: 350 Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank Material | Delivery l\/lljaetlcievr;arly+ Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 70.00 9.50 79.50 2 63.00 8.00 71.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 11.00 81.00 2 63.00 9.00 72.00 1 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 70.00 11.50 81.50 2 63.00 9.00 72.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 12.00 82.00 2 63.00 10.00 73.00 1 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 70.00 10.00 80.00 2 63.00 8.00 71.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 11.50 81.50 2 63.00 9.00 72.00 1 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 70.00 12.000 8200 2 | 6300 1000 73.00] 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 70.00 1250 8250 2 | 63.00] 11.00] 74.00] 1 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 70.00 14.00] 8400 2 | 6300 11.00] 74.00] 1 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 70.00 1050 8050 2 | 63.00] 9.000 72.00] 1 | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 70.00'******** | P1-2,P2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2 63.00'******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,TS-1 |******** |
Pick-Up Location 1768 N. Nursery Dr. Nursery, Tx New Taiton
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Pot Hole Emulsion (CWP) PZ
Unit: Gallons
ity: Material + Material + Material +

Ve REUE L Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 2.99| | 299 1 | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 2.99| | 299 1 | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location
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Stabilizer, Recycled Road Base e Rlecycling

Unit: Tons

fotaliQuantity-500 Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up 3.50|******** | PLLP2-LP3LPALTS |******** | |******** |
Pick-Up Location none listed
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Stabilizer, Cement with Application N 0 BI D N O BI D N 0 BI D

Unit: Tons

Vel O ElEE T Material | Delivery Matgrial ¥ Material | Delivery Matgrial ¥ Material | Delivery Matgrial ¥

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2020
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Stabilizer, Portland Cement (3%) with

Application NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dl et . . Material + . . Material + . . Material +

Total Quantity: 850 Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank Material | Delivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00| | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location
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1/2/2020



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2020 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

26

Stabilizer, Road with Application NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit: Gallons

lotaliQuantity:16,750 Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank Material | Delivery I\/lljz;tlcievr;ary Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | 0.00| | | | 0.00] | | 0.00]
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location
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1 2

Stabilizer, Road Product Only Charter Chemical Jaco

Unit: Gallons

Vel L Material | Delivery Matc.arial ¥ Material | Delivery Matc.arial ¥ Material | Delivery Matc.arial ¥

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.50 0.00 11.50 1 15.50 0.00 15.50 2 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 11.50] 000/ 1150 1 | 1550 0.00] 1550 2 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 11.50] 0.00f 1150 1 | 1550 0.00] 1550 2 | | 0.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 11.50] 000/ 1150 1 | 1550 0.00] 1550 2 | | 0.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 11.50] 000] 1150 1 | 1550 0.00] 1550 2 | | 0.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 11.50'******** | P1-1,P2-1,P3-1,P4-1,T5-1 15.50|******** | P1-2,P2-2,P3-2,P4-2,TS-2 |******** | |
Pick-Up Location none listed none listed
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NOTES:

Colorado Material: Delivery 1 calendar day.
*JACO: Safety data sheet attached.
*Lhoist: Hours of Allowable Demurrage at NO Charge - 2 hours

Hourly Rate AFTER hours of Allowable Demurrage at no Charge - $85 per hour
*Quality Hot Mix: All deliveries in end dump trailers. Belly dumps may be requested and will be provided if available.

*Waller County Asphalt: Cold Mix material bid by Waller County Asphalt falls under TXDOT DMs 9202 (ASPPM) All Season Pre-
Coated Patching mixture Grade IV. Polymer Modified High Performance Cold Mix.
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